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TOWN OF OAKVILLE / COMMITTEE OF ADJUSTMENT 

 

APPLICATION FOR C OF A  RE 181 FRONT STREET 

PREPARED BY  WILLIAM HICKS 

Date November 25, 2024 

 

PLANNING RATIONAL STATEMENT 

 

The owner of 181 Front Street has lived in this property for a number of years and his family is 
expanding and he wishes to remain in the old Oakville Heritage District and to reconstruct a new 
home and demolish the existing which was built a number of years ago. 

The existing home on the site interestingly enough already exceeds the allowable coverage and 
gross floor area on the site.  Knowing that it does not meet the intent of their family and their desire 
to remain on the site they wish to add approximately 500 sq ft to the house to accommodate 4 
bedrooms and some common living area. 

They intend to incorporate the garage into the structure which recognizes that it will be setback and 
less obtrusive as a single car garage. 

The new development will meet all the setback requirements and is well under the maximum height 
on the site as it was designed with the intent of meeting the requirements of the new heritage study 
which has not been concluded yet. 

There have been two to three discussions with Heritage on this application and revisions made 
along the way to satisfy their concerns and they have now recommended that we proceed with the 
C of A application.  We will then , subject to approval by the Committee finalize our heritage 
applications. 

We have also attended the preconsult meeting with planning and their concerns at that time were 
more or less in line with Heritages comments and thus by resolving heritage concerns I believe 
planning will support the application. 

We recognize we also are subject to Halton Conservation approval as we are within their area of 
approval but we do not expect any concerns with them as we are well beyond their traditional 30 M 
setback plus slope stability line as it ends on the property across the street. Notwithstanding that 
we still require their approval which we will apply for subject to C of A applications. 

 

There are two variances required to permit this proposal to proceed.  The reasons for these are 
outlined below: 

 



COVERAGE 

The bylaw permits a maximum coverage of  25% due to the special provision zoning and its location 
within the heritage district. 

The existing house is in fact  26.52% and we are proposing a coverage of  29.72 %. 

Much of this  is due to the covered porch in the back garden  and the front porch added to support 
heritage concerns with the distinction of the front entry and to reduce any impact of the garage. 

It is interesting to note that at some time the back northwestern corner of this site was cut off thus 
lowering its total lot area which accounts for about 1% of the excess coverage. 

 

FLOOR AREA / LOT RATIO 

The bylaw  permits 30% in this area and we are proposing 42% 

The existing house is already 37% and the increased area to be added for their growing family  
pushes this to  42% from the current 37% 

It is interesting to note that at some time the back northwestern corner of this site was cut off thus 
lowering its total lot area which accounts for about 1% of the excess floor area. 

The home has been pushed back to meet the required front yard setback at the suggestion of 
heritage and to create a balanced streetscape. 

The house is designed so the roof line steps down as per the suggestions of the heritage district 
guidelines. 

The existing house itself is not a house of heritage interest even though it is in the district and 
demolition will be supported. 

This is not a development [play to build and resell as these clients have already bought an alternate 
house in the area that can meet their needs through the construction process and then they will 
come back to 181 front street. 

I believe the proposed new house fits very well with the guidelines and intent of the district. It has 
been changed from a decidedly modern structure to one that is more traditional with shingle siding 
and the height of the eaves has been reduced as well as the floor area. 

We believe it meets the intent and purpose of the four tests under the planning act and it is a 
desirable development within the district that reinforces their objectives and goals regardless of the 
two variances. 

They are excited to proceed, and we look forward to our discussions. 

Yours Truly 

William R Hicks  

B Arch, OAA, MRAIC 
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